
 

Hong Kong Exchanges and Clearing Limited and The Stock Exchange of Hong Kong Limited take no 
responsibility for the contents of this announcem ent, make no representation as to its accuracy or com pleteness 
and expressly disclaim any liability whatsoever for any loss how soever arising from or in reliance upon the 
whole or any part of the contents of this announcement.  
 
This announcem ent is for inform ation purposes only and does not co nstitute an invitation or offer to acquire, 
purchase or subscribe for securities.  
 
This announcem ent does not constitute or form a part of any offer or solicitation to purchase or subscribe for 
securities in the United States. The securities have not been, and will not be, registered under the U.S. Securities 
Act of 1933, as amended (the “Securities Act”) or with any securities regulatory authority of any state of the 
United States or other jurisdiction. The securities are being offered and sold outside the  United States in reliance 
on Regulation S under the Securities Act and may not be offered or sold withi n the United States absent 
registration or an exem ption from registration under the Securities Act. No public offering of the securities will 
be made in the United States or in any other jurisdiction where such an offering is restricted or prohibited. 
 

UPDATE ON USE OF PROCEEDS 
 

Shandong Iron and Steel Xinheng International Company Limited  
(inco rp o ra te d with limite d lia b ility in th e British Virgin Isla n d s)  

(the “Issuer”)  
 

U.S.$500,000,000 6.85 per cent. Guaranteed Bonds due 2022 (the “Bonds”) 
(Stock Code: 40003) 

 
Unconditionally and Irrevocably Guaranteed by 

 
Shandong Iron & Steel Group Co., Ltd. 

(山東鋼鐵集團有限公司)                                  
(inco rp o ra te d with limite d lia b ility in th e People ’ s Repub lic of China)   

(the “Guarantor”)  
 

Reference is made to the announcement of the Issuer and the Guarantor dated 25 September 2019 (the 
“Announcement”) and the offering circular dated 18 September 2019 relating to the offering of the Bonds. 
Capitalised terms used herein shall have the same meanings as those defined in the Announcement unless 
otherwise stated. 
 
It was disclosed in the Offering Circular that the net proceeds from the offering of the Bonds would be used for 
repayment of the existing indebtedness of the Guarantor’s offshore subsidiaries and general corporate purposes. 
By way of update, the Issuer and the Guarantor hereby announce that the net proceeds from the offering of the 
Bonds have been used for repayment of the existing onshore and offshore indebtedness of the Guarantor’s 
offshore subsidiaries only. 
 
10 January 2020 
 
As at the  date of this announcem ent, the director s  of the Issuer  are Wang Lei and Zhao Weitian.  
 
As at the date of this announcement, the directors of the Guarantor are Hou Jun, Su Bin , Chen Xiangyang, Liu 
Dehua , Wang Hongwei , Zhong Zhigang, Liang Fu and  Lu Tongshu.  


